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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 1, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

1 ea. *

15,000 GVWR (minimum) 4-door, crew-cab truck with mounted fiberglass utility body, UNIT PRICE 58,334.00 60,505.00

complete per specifications TOTAL 58,334.00 60,505.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F450 Crew Cab 2015 Ford F450 Crew Cab 4x2

A. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 180 days 105-125 days

26 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short bed (no outside fenders), extended, club, UNIT PRICE 22,739.00 22,779.00 24,995.00 25,050.00 26,445.80 26,158.55

super cab pickup trucks, per specifications TOTAL 591,214.00 592,254.00 649,870.00 651,300.00 687,590.80 680,122.30

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F150 Supercab 4x2 X1E 2014 Ford F150 Super Cab 4x2 Chev 1500 Silverado CC15753 Ram 1500 DS1L41 2015 Chev CC15753 Chev CC15753

B. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days 120 days 60-75 days Deliver week of 9/15/14 120 days

3 ea. *

9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, UNIT PRICE 34,297.00 34,769.00 39,716.46 39,111.81

club, super cab pickup trucks, complete, per specifications TOTAL 102,891.00 104,307.00 NO BID NO BID 119,149.38 117,335.43

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F250 Supercab 4x2 X2B 2015 Ford F250 Super Cab 4x4 2015 Chev CK25753 2015 Chev CK25753

C. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days Deliver week of 8/11/14 120 days

1 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside), club, crew-cab UNIT PRICE 29,975.00 31,123.00 29,384.00 32,683.05 32,621.55

pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 29,975.00 31,123.00 NO BID 29,384.00 32,683.05 32,621.55

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F150 Super crew 4x4 X1B 2014 Ford F150 Crew Cab 4x4 Ram 1500 DS6L91 2015 Chev CK15543 2014 Chev CK15543

D. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days 60-75 days Deliver week of 9/15/14 120 days

1 ea. *

9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and long type bed (no fender outside) single rear UNIT PRICE 35,826.00 37,347.00 43,093.00 40,881.46 41,074.86

wheels, crew-cab/quad-cab pickup truck, complete, per specifications TOTAL 35,826.00 37,347.00 NO BID 43,093.00 40,881.46 41,074.86

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F250 Crew Cab 4x4 LWB W2B 2015 Ford F250 Crew Cab 4x4 2015 Ram 2500 DJ7L92 2015 Chev. CK25943 2015 Chev CK25943

E. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days 60-75 days Deliver week of 8/11/14 120 days

7 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, UNIT PRICE 26,171.00 26,541.00 28,995.00 26,731.00 30,254.65 30,113.15

club, super cab pickup trucks, complete, per specifications TOTAL 183,197.00 185,787.00 202,965.00 187,117.00 211,782.55 210,792.05

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F150 Super Cab 4x4 X1E 2014 Ford F150 Super Cab 4x4 Chev 1500 Silverado CK15753 Ram 1500 DS6L41 2015 Chev CK15753 2014 Chev CK15753

F. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days 120 days 60-75 days Deliver week of 9/15/14 120 days

1 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, UNIT PRICE 26,995.00 27,213.00 29,625.00 27,780.00 31,554.65 30,772.85

club, super cab pickup trucks, complete, per specifications TOTAL 26,995.00 27,213.00 29,625.00 27,780.00 31,554.65 30,772.85

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F150 Super Cab 4x4 X1E 2014 Ford F150 Super Cab 4x4 Chev 1500 Silverado CK15753 Ram 1500 DS6L41 2015 Chev CK15753 2014 Chev. CK15753

G. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days 120 days 60-75 days Deliver week of 9/15/14 120 days

8 ea. *

4,600 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short type bed (no-fender outside) extended, UNIT PRICE 26,545.00

access, super cab pickup trucks, complete, per specifications TOTAL NO BID NO BID 212,360.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Chev Extended Cab 4x2

H. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 1, 2014
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY C
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1 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, UNIT PRICE 23,682.00 23,579.00 26,995.00 26,099.00 26,959.00 26,742.55

club, super cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 23,682.00 23,579.00 26,995.00 26,099.00 26,959.00 26,742.55

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F150 Super Cab 4x2 X1C 2014 Ford F150 Super Cab 4x2 Chev 1500 Silverado CC15753 Ram 1500 DS1L41 2015 Chev CC15753 2014 Chev CC15753

I. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days 120 days 60-75 days Deliver week of 9/15/14 120 days

1 ea. *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, UNIT PRICE 29,605.00 27,409.00 32,668.25 30,563.15

club, super cab pickup truck per specifications TOTAL 29,605.00 27,409.00 NO BID NO BID 32,668.25 30,563.15

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F150 Super Cab 4x4 X1E 2014 Ford F150 Super Cab 4x2 2015 Chev CK15753 2014 Chev CK15753

J. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days Deliver week of 9/15/14 120 days

1 ea. *

9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no fender outside) extended, club, super UNIT PRICE 36,518.00 37,179.00 42,366.46 41,219.96

cab pickup truck with mounted 1,300 lb. powered lift gate, complete, per specifications TOTAL 36,518.00 37,179.00 NO BID NO BID 42,366.46 41,219.96

State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Ford F250 Super Cab 4x4 SWB X2B 2015 Ford F250 Super Cab 4x4 2015 Chev. CK25753 2015 Chev CK25753

K. Delivery Days DELIVERY DAYS 120 days 75-105 days Deliver week of 8/11/14 120 days

Net Net Net 2% Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days 30 days 30 days

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Ancira Chrysler Jeep Dodge Freedom Chevrolet Park Cities Ford Lincoln  Demandstar

Autonation Chrysler Dodge Grande Ford Red McCombs Dodge SAWS Website

Bluebonnet Chrsler Dodge Grapevine Dodge, Chrysler, Jeep Red McCombs Toyota

Caldwell Country Ford Grayson Johnson Motors Reliable Chevrolet

Cavender Chevrolet Gulf States Toyota Sam Pack's Five Star Ford

Chapperral Dodge, Inc. Gunn Chevrolet Tom Benson Chevrolet

Dallas Dodge Henna Chevrolet Toyota of Boerne

Dodge Superstore Leif Johnson Ford
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